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Brent Cross Cricklewood Transformation Update  

Have your say on the future of Clitterhouse Playing Fields in
our public consultation

Clitterhouse Playing Fields is at the heart of our vision for Brent
Cross Town, and we need your help to make it one of north
London’s most significant public parks.

A public consultation has been launched on the future of this 44-
acre green space, which is the equivalent size of 22 football
pitches. The goal is to provide a wide variety of new sports and play
facilities that are accessible to everyone, as well as clear and safe
walking routes throughout. But that requires you telling us what you
want, as we reinvent it as an area where people can relax and
enjoy green spaces, grab a coffee, and meet with friends.

Read the full story, including how you can have your say, plus
details of the four public events where you can learn more in
person, here.

https://brentcrossthameslink.createsend1.com/t/d-e-ajrlhhl-l-p/
https://brentcrossthameslink.createsend1.com/t/d-l-ajrlhhl-l-r/
https://brentcrossthameslink.createsend1.com/t/d-l-ajrlhhl-l-y/


 

Brent Cross Town's first public artwork

This is the first public artwork in Brent Cross Town, a mural which
mixes colour, inclusion, local history, and community spirit.

Designed by artist Annu Kilpeläinen, it pays homage to 19th century
local botanist William Cattley. Local people were asked what they
wanted before the work was commissioned.

The mural covers the gable wall on the parade of shops on
Claremont Way. You can read the full story, including a video of the
artwork being installed, here.

https://brentcrossthameslink.createsend1.com/t/d-l-ajrlhhl-l-j/


Become an apprentice groundworker

Are you a young person who wants to help build a new park town in
north London, or do you know someone who is? Because a new
role has been created which could be perfect.

Our partner Galldris is advertising an 18-month apprenticeship as a
groundworker on Brent Cross Town. Galldris and a training provider
will offer the candidate the training required and the qualification of
a CSCS card.

Read how to apply here.

https://brentcrossthameslink.createsend1.com/t/d-l-ajrlhhl-l-t/


 

Join the team at our Visitor Pavilion

Four jobs are also being advertised at Brent Cross Town's Visitor
Pavilion and Welcome Hub which will both open next month.

We are looking for a general manager, plus three welcome hosts
who will be either part-time or full-time. You will be the public face of
the development, meeting everyone from local school and
community groups, to visiting professionals, clients, stakeholders
and colleagues.

Learn more about the positions and how to apply here.

https://brentcrossthameslink.createsend1.com/t/d-l-ajrlhhl-l-i/


 

Junction works project nearly complete

Our highways improvements are nearly complete at the A5
Cricklewood Broadway junction with Cricklewood Lane and
Chichele Road.

Over the last 12 months we have demolished the four-storey
building at the corner of Cricklewood Lane and Cricklewood
Broadway, widened and realigned the junction with Chichele
Road, modernised the signals, renovated the footways, and
installed new pedestrian crossings.

To learn more about the works, click here.
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